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Vunetrix Promotes New Director of Sales, West 
“Vunetrix Announces Cristine Wick as new Director of Sales, West” 

 
[Seattle, WA, December 17, 2019] – Vunetrix INC., a global leader in physical security health and 
performance monitoring, is excited to announce the promotion of Cristine Wick to Director of Sales, 
West. Cristine is responsible for directly overseeing the sales and customer service functions for the 
Mountain and Pacific regions of North America. As a well-known and accomplished security 
professional, Cristine is respected across the industry as a trusted advisor to both integrators and 
end users helping to solve their biggest challenges through innovative technological solutions.  
 
As the Director of Sales, West for Vunetrix, Cristine will lead the growth of Vunetrix out West and 
build a team to further the company’s expansion. Cristine has continued to apply more than 20 years 
of sales experience and has been integral in helping Vunetrix create sales, marketing, and educational 
materials to help build trust in Vunetrix expertise and facilitating purchasing decisions which 
strengthen physical security.  
 
Curtis Nikel, CEO of Vunetrix shared this, “We are very excited to have Cristine take on this important 
role. For the last two years, Cristine has been an integral part of Vunetrix growth and adoption by 
integrators, consultants, and end users alike. Cristine’s experience has proven to bring together the 
best individuals to help businesses advance and identify their ROI strategies when using Vunetrix. 
The West has become an enormous market for Vunetrix and having it led by Cristine ensures we are 
positioned for continued growth.” 
 
“What I love about Vunetrix is we provide a solution which ensures the entire IP security ecosystem 
is working as it was designed to do. In my 20 + years in the security industry, I have yet to meet a 
customer who has not felt the pain of missing video after a security incident because something 
failed. Vunetrix solves this problem and so much more. I look forward to building a team which 
believes in changing the security industry as much as I do.” said Cristine.  
 
About Vunetrix 
Vunetrix is a Seattle, Wash.-based enterprise physical security software company which safeguards 
its clients with an always-on, proven network monitoring tool. The core software, Vunetrix Network 
Monitor (VNM), issues real-time alerts of security system device health and performance anomalies 
and failures; integrates with various OEM devices connected to a physical security network and 
delivers real-time reports in a single-view dashboard. Vunetrix award-winning products are deployed 
by law enforcement and public safety organizations, government and transportation agencies, major 
enterprises, healthcare, property management, retail, and educational institutions. For more 
information, visit www.vunetrix.com.   
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